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Tuesday, 4.6.2019 
Search literature 
with AI (No. 42) 
Qinsight is the first artificial 
intelligence (AI) big data 
discovery platform for bio-
medical literature with over 40 
million documents including 
patents – and now also full 
text from Oxford University 
Press journals. Advanced 
visual analytics enable deeper 
understanding – way beyond 
listing the results. 
Presenter: Dr. Oliver Renn 
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Wednesday, 5.6.2019 
Reaction Flash & 
apoc (No. 57) 
You need to learn named 
organic reactions for the 
exam? Boost your knowledge 
on over 800 named reactions 
using the free game app 
Reaction Flash, or the app 
apoc, created by Niels 
Sievertsen, Carreira group. 
Presenter: Niels Sievertsen 

Thursday, 6.6.2019 
Learn new skills with 
Lynda (No. 62) 
Do you want to get a quick 
start to learn Photoshop or 
Illustrator? Or do you need the 
basics of Python in a crash 
course tonight? The video 
courses of Lynda.com provide 
skills for software, creativity 
and business taught by 
experts.  
Presenter: Dr. Joachim Schnabl 
 

 		
	

Grow and complete your 
collection of Coffee Lecture 

Collector’s Cards! 
 
Tuesday, 11.6.2019 
Interacting with 
predatory publishers 
(No. 41) 
Predatory journals are spam-
ming our mailboxes with 
publication invitations. While 
these never-ending solicita-
tions are more often than not 
annoying, they can also be an 
unsuspected source of fun. 
Presenter: Prof. JC Leroux 
 
Wednesday, 12.6.2019 
Stay up-to-date with 
journal eTocs and 
Google Alerts (No. 4) 
Both Google Alerts and eTocs 
are good tools to receive 
information on your topics of 
interests and to stay tuned. 
Presenter: Dr. Leo Betschart 
 
 

Thursday, 13.6.2019 
Use the full power of 
Scopus (No. 17) 
Scopus offers many opportuni-
ties to retrieve literature 
expand your searches, to 
make them more specific and 
to analyze results in several 
ways. We'll show you when 
and where it is worth to do 
additional clicks. 
Presenter: Dr. Oliver Renn 
 
Tuesday, 18.6.2019 
No longer guessing 
with CASSI (No. 20) 
CASSI is a free resource that 
can be used to quickly find 
journal name abbreviations or 
to resolve them. 
Presenter: Dr. Leo Betschart 
 
Wednesday, 19.6.2019 
Kudos (No. 43) 
Do you want to spread out 
words about your paper not 
only through the journal in 
which you have published? 
Kudos helps researchers ex-
plain, enrich and share their 
publications for greater re-
search impact – especially for 
the D-CHAB members. 
Presenter: Dr. Joachim Schnabl 
 
Thursday, 20.6.2019 
Beyond data: 
Springer Materials 
Interactive (No. 30) 
SpringerMaterials, the world’s 
largest database of physical 
and chemical properties, 
introduced a set of advanced 
interactive visualization and 
analysis tools that help you 
search and explore the data 
from its large and diverse 
collection. 
Presenter: Dr. Jozica Dolenc 

http://www.infozentrum.ethz.ch/

